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AGENDA 
CITY OF NEWTON  

NEWTON CITY COUNCIL - REGULAR MEETING 
October 6, 2020  

     7:00 p.m. 
   1. Call to Order –  Mayor Eddie Haupt 
   
   2. Opening – Council Member Jody Dixon 
 
   3. Approval of Minutes from the September 22, 2020, 7:30 pm Special Meeting 
 
   4. Consideration of Consent Agenda Items 
    

A. Sewer Adjustments 
 

B. Resolution Promoting Public Power Week, October 4-10, 2020 
 

C. Proclamation – Fire Prevention Week, October 4-10, 2020 
 

D. Consideration of Appointment to Boards and Commissions 
Business Advisory Committee – David Hayes 

 
E. Consideration to Refurbish Downtown Clock 

 
    5. Comments from the Public: (IF YOU WOULD LIKE TO MAKE A PUBLIC COMMENT 

ON NON-AGENDA ITEMS PLEASE SIGN IN WITH THE CITY CLERK PRIOR TO 
THE MEETING): 

 
   6. Presentations 
 

A. Comprehensive Annual Financial Report 
 
   7. New Business 
 

A. Consideration to Accept Tree Trimming Bid 
 

B. Consideration of State Revolving Loan for the East 2nd Street Sewer Rehabilitation/  
Reclocation 

 
C. Consideration of a Provisional Offer to Purchase and Contract for Acquisition of  

Real Property 
 

D. CARES Act Funding 
 
   8. City Manager’s Report 
 
   9. Questions and Comments From Mayor and Council 
 

A. Reports from Appointed Representatives on Outside Boards – Council Member Jerry 
Hodge 

 
  10. Closed Session - Per North Carolina General Statutes 143-318.11(a)(6) 

   
  11. Adjournment 
 
 
The City of Newton holds all public meetings in accessible rooms. Special requests for accommodations should be submitted by individuals at least 

48 hours before the scheduled meeting time.  Please call 828-695-4266 or 828-695-4261 for special accommodations. 



MINUTES 
SPECIAL MEETING OF THE NEWTON CITY COUNCIL 

September 22, 2020 – 7:30 p.m. 
 
The special meeting of the Newton City Council was held at 7:30 p.m. Tuesday, September 22, 2020 at Newton City 
Hall. 
 
PRESENT:  Mayor Eddie Haupt, Mayor Pro Tem John Stiver and Council Members Jerry Hodge, Anne Wepner, 

Jody Dixon, Beverly Danner and Ed Sain 
 
STAFF:  City Manager Todd Clark, Assistant City Manager Sean Hovis, City Clerk Amy S. Falowski, City 

Attorney John Cilley, City Department Heads and members of the management team    
 
ITEM 1: CALL TO ORDER  
 
Mayor Eddie Haupt welcomed everyone and called the meeting to order.  
 
 
ITEM 2: APPROVAL OF MINUTES from the September 22, 2020, 7:30 p.m. Special Meeting  
 
Upon motion duly made by Mayor Pro Tem John Stiver, seconded by Council Member Anne Wepner, it was 
unanimously RESOLVED: 
  

That the Minutes from the September 22, 2020, 7:30 p.m. Special Meeting be 
– APPROVED 

 
ITEM 3: Consideration of Award of Bid for Annual Street Paving Project 
 
Public Works and Utilities Director Dusty Wentz stated that the following street segments have been selected by staff 
from the Asphalt and Sidewalk Condition assessment completed in late 2015 and also based upon recent visual 
inspections completed by city staff. Mr. Wents stated that the following selected streets have been identified based on 
the level of degradation and the amount of funding staff anticipates receiving this fiscal year for street resurfacing 
projects.   
 

Base 1 E. Herman St: Mill and Resurface 
Base 2 Hamilton Dr. from Valley to Westside: Replacement 
Alt 1 Brentwood Cir from Pinehurst to Brentwood Dr.: Replacement 
Alt 2 W. 6th St.: Mill and Resurface 
Alt 3 Chandy St.: Mill and Resurface 
Alt 4 Cobble Stone Ct: Mill and Resurface 

 
Mr. Wentz stated that Staff has solicited for bids from local contractors and that the first round of bidding only received 
two bids.  Per State law the city is required to obtain three bids, so the project was re-bid and staff received three bids 
on the second attempt. All three bids were found to be complete and accurate.  The low bid per street segment is 
highlighted for your convenience.   
 
Mr. Wentz advised that Midstate Construction and J.T. Russell have agreed to “split” the bid, allowing the City to 
award a contract to each firm based on the lowest bid for each street.  The construction cost for both contracts is 
$421,740, with a 10% contingency of $42,174, the total cost is $463,914. 
 
Mr. Wentz explained that as reported in the September 15, 2020 City Council Agenda packet, the amount of funding 
for street paving that was appropriated by City Council in the current FY 2021 budget is $538,500.  This included 
funding from a new Vehicle Tag Fee as well as revenue from the State Powell Bill Fund.  Mr. Wentz stated that staff 
has revisited revenue projections for the current fiscal year and the budget for street paving has been adjusted down 
based on several factors.  First, we have contacted the State of North Carolina Department of Transportation Powell 
Bill Program to obtain an update on projected Powell Bill fund distributions this year which can fluctuate based upon 
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actual fuel tax receipts.  Due to COVID-19, the actual volume of fuel purchased is expected to be lower and therefore 
we believe state funding will be lower.  Although the Powell Bill staff will not be able to provide accurate estimates 
until October, we believe a conservative estimate of the amount of Powell Bill funding that will be available for paving 
will be $140,000.  Second, the County could not begin processing the new Vehicle Tag Fee until September so the 
revenue generated will include approximately nine months instead of the twelve months of billings originally projected.  
Mr. Wentz stated this is estimated to produce $260,000 of revenue, bringing the total estimated amount of funding for 
street paving to $400,000. 
 
Mr. Wentz stated that in consideration of the very favorable bids the city received, staff recommends moving forward 
with the paving projects as recommended, but with an appropriation of $50,000 from Powell Bill Fund Balance.  This 
$50,000 is the balance remaining from the $200,000 transfer from the General Fund in FY2019 that was originally 
designated to be used for sidewalks. City Council should be aware, however, that if the full 10% contingency is needed, 
we will exceed our revenue estimate by $13,914.  In addition, this is the first year implementing the Vehicle Tag Fee, 
so that revenue estimate is less certain and could result in the need to use Fund Balance to cover any revenue 
deficiencies.  Mr. Wentz stated that if City Council elects to move forward with the staff recommendation, Staff will 
closely monitor the Street Department budget through the remainder of the fiscal year. 
 
Mr. Wentz stated Sstaff recommends the approval of the attached budget ordinance amendment in the amount of 
$50,000.   
 
Also, Staff recommends awarding the bid for the Annual Overlay project as follows: 
 

• Base Bid 2 (Hamilton) and Alternate 1 (Brentwood) be awarded to Midstate Construction in the amount of 
$210,580.   

• Base Bid 1 (E. Herman) and Alternate 3 (Chandy) be awarded to J.T. Russell in the amount of $211,160.   
 
Upon motion duly made by Mayor Pro Tem John Stiver, seconded by Council Member Ed Sain, it was unanimously 
RESOLVED: 
   That the Budget Ordinance Amendment be – ADOPTED 
 
Upon motion duly made by Mayor Pro Tem John Stiver, seconded by Council Member Ed Sain, it was unanimously 
RESOLVED: 

That the Base Bid 2 (Hamilton) and Alternate 1 (Brentwood) be Awarded to Midstate 
Construction in the amount of $210,580 be - APPROVED 

 
Upon motion duly made by Council Member Jody Dixon, seconded by Council Member Ed Sain, it was 
unanimously RESOLVED: 
 

That the Base Bid 1 (E. Herman) and Alternate 3 (Chandy) be Aarded to J.T. Russell in the 
Amount of $211,160 be - APPROVED 

 
(Ordinances, Resolutions and Proclamations are hereby referenced and on file in the Office of the City Clerk) 
 
ITEM 4: Adjournment 

 
Upon motion duly made by Council Member Jody Dixon, seconded by Council Member Ed Sain, it was 
unanimously RESOLVED: 
 
  That the Meeting be – ADJOURNED  

 
           ________________________________ 
           Eddie Haupt, Mayor  

_________________________________ 
          Amy S. Falowski, City Clerk 
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CITY OF NEWTON 
 

Sewer Adjustments 
 
 
 
TO:    E. Todd Clark, City Manager       DATE:   9/28/2020 
RE:   Sewer Adjustments – 10/6/2020     
FROM:  Vickie Thomas, Finance Director       
 
 
The following sewer adjustment is recommended for approval.  The adjustment is 
recommended as a result of a water leak at the service address or a pool fill up. 
 

Account 
Number 

Name Service Address Adjustment 
Period 

Amount of 
Adjustment 

19000390-002 Jerry Shephard 2636 Touchstone Cir July- Aug 141.08 

46000200-001 Rebecca Smith 215 Kilborne Dr Aug 31.35 

 
 
Backup documentation to support each adjustment is on file in the Finance Department. 
 Should you have questions or require further clarification, please notify. 
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Resolution  
Promoting NC Public Power During 

Public Power Week, October 4-10, 2020 
 

WHEREAS, public power is a crucial component in cities and towns across North Carolina, 
contributing to the overall health of communities by providing reliable electricity, excellent local 
service and prompt restoration;  
 
WHEREAS, North Carolina’s more than 70 public power cities and towns are among more than 
2,000 across the country;  
 
WHEREAS, many of North Carolina’s public power cities and towns have been electric providers for 
more than 100 years;  
 
WHEREAS, public power meets the electric needs of 40 million Americans, almost 15 percent of 
electricity consumers;  
 
WHEREAS, North Carolina’s public power utilities are valuable community assets that contribute to 
the well-being of the community and provide economic development opportunities; and, 
 
WHEREAS, North Carolina’s public power utilities are dependable institutions that provide 
excellent service and a commitment to community; now, therefore be it  
  
RESOLVED, that the week of October 4-10, 2020, is Public Power Week, a week to promote North 
Carolina’s public power cities and towns for their contributions to their communities; 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that NC Public Power communities join with all public power systems 
in the United States in this celebration of public power. 
 
Adopted this day of October 6, 2020. 
 
 
       ________________________________ 
        Eddie Haupt, Mayor 
 
 
_____________________________________ 
           Amy S. Falowski, City Clerk 
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CITY OF NEWTON 
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION 

 
 
TO:   E. Todd Clark, City Manager   DATE: September 21, 2020 
FROM:  Kevin Yoder, Fire Chief         
ACTION REQUESTED: Proclamation designating the recognition of Fire Prevention Week.  

           

 Approved for Council Consideration 
 

      ____________________________________ 
 

1. Each year the Fire Service recognizes the week of October 9th as Fire Prevention Week. 
 
2. This date commemorates the anniversary of the “Great Chicago Fire”. 
 
3. During this week each year, Fire Departments nationwide double their efforts to educate 

the public on the dangers of fire and stress the importance of fire safety to school children 
and other members of the public. 

 
4. The City of Newton Fire Department recognizes this week by encouraging the citizens of 

Newton to remember and put into practice the simple but important actions they can take 
to keep themselves, and those around them, safe. 

  

                    
 
Action Suggested: Proclamation designating the recognition of Fire Prevention Week.   
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City of Newton Proclamation  

Fire Prevention Week 
 

WHEREAS, the City of Newton is committed to ensuring the safety and security of all those living in and visiting our 
city; and 

WHEREAS, fire is a serious public safety concern both locally and nationally, and homes are where people are at greatest 
risk to fire; and 

WHEREAS, nearly 3,000 people die each year as a result of home fires; and 

WHEREAS, roughly two-thirds of home fire deaths resulted from home fires in which no smoke alarms or no working 
smoke alarms were present; and 
 
WHEREAS, working smoke alarms cut the chance of dying in a reported fire in half; and 
 
WHEREAS, the National Fire Protection Association recommends at least one smoke alarm on every level of the home 
(including the basement) outside all sleeping areas, and in all bedrooms; and 
 
WHEREAS, informing the public about the importance of smoke alarm installation and maintenance serves as an 
essential step toward increasing the public’s safety from home fires; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Newton Fire Department is dedicated to reducing the occurrence of home fires and home fire 
deaths and injuries through prevention and proper education; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City of Newton’s residents are responsive to public education measures and are able to take personal 
responsibility to increase their safety from fire, especially in their homes; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Fire Prevention Week 2020, October 4th-10th theme, “Serve Up Fire Safety in the Kitchen” works to 
educate everyone about the simple but important actions they can take to keep themselves, and those around them, safe in 
the kitchen; 
  
NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that I, Eddie Haupt, Mayor of the City of Newton, do hereby proclaim October  
4th - 10th, 2020 as Fire Prevention Week throughout this City, and I urge all people of Newton to protect their homes and 
families by heeding the potentially life-saving messages of Fire Prevention Week 2020, and to support the many activities 
and efforts of the City of Newton’s fire and emergency services. 
 
 
This 6th day of October, 2020 
 
       ______________________________ 
                    Eddie Haupt, Mayor 
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CITY OF NEWTON 
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION 

 
 
DATE:  September 29, 2020 
 
TO:  City Council 
 
FROM:  Eddie Haupt, Mayor 
 
CONSIDERATION OF:  Appointment  
 
Members of City Council, I would like to recommend the appointment of David Hayes to the 
Business Advisory Committee.   
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CITY OF NEWTON 
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION 

 
 
DATE:  October 1, 2020 
 
TO:  E. Todd Clark, City Manager 
 
FROM:  Sean Hovis, Assistant City Manager  
 
CONSIDERATION OF:  Restoration of City Clock 
 

Approved for Council Consideration 
 

_ 
_____________________________ 

 
The City clock has been returned to the intersection of A Street and College Avenue beside Yount Park 
following the completion of the second phase of the Newton Streetscape Revitalization Project. The clock, 
an O.B. McClintock City Post Clock, will require restoration to operate correctly. Staff contacted Jim Van 
Orsdel of The Clock Shop in Charlotte to gather more information about restoring the clock. Mr. Van Orsdel 
inspected the clock on Sept. 20 and determined several new parts will be needed for the clock to operate 
correctly. 
 
The cost of restoration is $7,486, which includes all necessary parts and as many visits as required by Mr. 
Van Orsdel to ensure the clock is operating correctly. All parts associated with the restoration will be 
guaranteed for a period of three years. The City will provide a hydraulic bucket lift with two staff members 
and a licensed electrician to complete the restoration under Mr. Van Orsdel’s supervision. 
 
Recommendation: 
  
Staff recommends City Council consider hiring Jim Van Orsdel of The Clock Shop to complete the 
restoration of the City clock, and to adopt the budget ordinance amendment. 
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ORDINANCE  
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND REVENUES AND EXPENDITURES FOR  
FISCAL YEAR 2020-2021 FOR THE CITY OF NEWTON 

 
 WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Newton have adopted a Budget Ordinance for fiscal 
year beginning July 1, 2020, and ending June 30, 2021, in accordance with the General Statutes of the 
State of North Carolina, and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council desires to appropriate funds to restore the City clock; 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council desires to approve utilization of fund balance and to approve the 
related expenditure appropriation within the operating budget; and  
  
 NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
NEWTON, NORTH CAROLINA, THAT: 
 
 THE FOLLOWING SOURCE OF REVENUE AND APPROPRIATION ARE HEREBY 
APPROVED.  
 
 
General Fund Revenues 
      Fund Balance Appropriation    11-0000.3990        $7,500 
      
General Fund Appropriations 
      Other Services     11-4120.6990            $7,500  
 
 
 
 
Adopted this 6th day of October, 2020. 
             
                       Eddie Haupt, Mayor 
 
 
 
     
  Amy S. Falowski, City Clerk  
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CITY OF NEWTON 
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION

 
DATE:  September 17, 2020 
 
TO:  E. Todd Clark, City Manager 
 
FROM:  Doug Wesson 
 
CONSIDERATION OF: Award Tree Trimming Contract 
 

Approved for Council Consideration 
 

 _________________________ 
 
Background: 

 
Staff requested bids for Tree Trimming services throughout its entire distribution system on August 25. 
Also, staff published a legal notice in the One Classified newspaper on the same date. Staff received the 
following bids: 
 

1. Asplundh Tree Expert     $144,795.48 
2. Wolf Tree, Inc.         No Bid 
3. Lewis Tree          No Bid     
4. Davey           No Bid     
5. Brent Mackey Tree Service        No Bid    

  
Staff had appropriated $150,000 for Fiscal Year 20-21.  
 
Since this is a service and not a construction contract, state law does not require three bids or Council 
approval.  The city’s purchasing policy, however, requires council approval for expenditures exceeding 
$90,000.  After reviewing the only bid, staff is recommending awarding tree trimming contract to 
Asplundh Tree Expert.    

 
Action Suggested: 
 

Staff is recommending Council to award the bid to Asplundh Tree Expert, LLC in the amount of 
$144,795.48 for fiscal year 20-21. 
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CITY OF NEWTON 
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION 

 
 
DATE:  October 1, 2020 
 
TO:  E. Todd Clark, City Manager 
 
FROM:  Vickie Thomas, Finance Director 
 
CONSIDERATION OF:  Consideration of State Revolving Loan for the East 2nd Street Sewer 
Relocation Project 

Approved for Council Consideration 
 
 
 

______________________________ 
 

Background: 
 
On October 2, 2018, the City applied to the North Carolina Department of Environmental 
Quality’s State Revolving Loan (SRF) program for funding the relocation of the East 2nd Street 
Sewer Line.  The Local Government Commission has reviewed and approved the proposed loan, 
and the City has now received “Funding Offer and Acceptance” documents for this loan. 
 
The sewer relocation loan is for $1,900,000, with $278,440 in principal forgiveness, a 0% 
interest rate and a twenty year term.  The loan requires a closing fee of 2%, estimated to be 
$38,000. 
 
The loan requires that the City Council adopt the attached Resolution accepting the offer and 
making the applicable assurances contained herein.   
 
Action Suggested: 
   
Approve the attached Resolution for the East 2nd Street Sewer State Revolving Loan. 
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RESOLUTION  
BY GOVERNING BODY OF APPLICANT 

 
WHEREAS, the North Carolina Clean Water Revolving Loan and Grant Act of 1987 has authorized 

the making of loans and grants to aid eligible units of government in financing the cost of 
construction of wastewater treatment works, wastewater collection systems, and water 
supply systems, water conservation projects, and 

 
WHEREAS, the North Carolina Department of Environmental Quality has offered a State Revolving 

Fund Loan in the amount of $1,900,000 for the relocation of the 2nd Street Sewer Line 
(Project No. CS370685-03), and 

 
WHEREAS, the City of Newton intends to construct said project in accordance with the approved 

plans and specifications, 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NEWTON: 
 

That City of Newton does hereby accept the State Revolving Loan offer of $1,900,000. 
 

That the City of Newton does hereby give assurance to the North Carolina Department of 
Environmental Quality that all items specified in the loan offer, Section II – Assurances will be 
adhered to. 

 
That E. Todd Clark, City Manager, and successors so titled, is hereby authorized and directed to 
furnish such information as the appropriate State agency may request in connection with such 
application or the project; to make the assurances as contained above; and to execute such other 
documents as may be required in connection with the application. 

 
That City of Newton has substantially complied or will substantially comply with all Federal, 
State and local laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances applicable to the project and to Federal 
and State grants and loans pertaining thereto. 

 
Adopted this the 6th day of October, 2020 in the City Council Chambers at City Hall in Newton, 
North Carolina. 

 
 
 
      __________________________________ 
       Eddie Haupt, Mayor 
 
 
 
_______________________________ 
     Amy S. Falowski, City Clerk 
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CITY OF NEWTON 
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION 

 
 
DATE:  October 2, 2020 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
 
FROM:  Todd Clark, City Manager 
 
CONSIDERATION OF:  Consideration of Provisional Offer to Purchase and Contract for Real Property 
 

Approved for Council Consideration 
 
 
 

______________________________ 
 
Background: 
 
The North Carolina Department of Transportation has listed several parcels of land for sale in the City of 
Newton.  The parcels are located at the intersection of 20th Street and NC Highway 16 (Thornburg Drive) 
and are further identified by Catawba County as GIS parcel numbers 374115723792 and 374119628175.   
City staff has attached maps to this Request for Council Action that depict the parcel locations relative to 
20th Street and NC Highway 16.   
 
The staff recommends that City Council consider the purchase of these parcels to enable the City to 
protect the appearance of a key gateway entry into the City. 
 
City Council is advised that one of the parcels was bisected when NC Highway 16 was constructed.  
Although the two parcels are separately deeded at the present time, NCDOT is marketing the property as 
three (3) separate parcels.  Consequently, NCDOT has provided three separate Offers to Purchase and 
Contract to the City for execution.  The City Attorney has reviewed each of the Offers to Purchase and 
Contract and has approved each as to form and content. 
 
The total cost for these three parcels is $1,690.  Two of the parcels are listed for $500 each with the third 
and final piece offered for $690.  The third parcel, which is listed for $690, is located on the northeast 
corner of the intersection of 20th Street and NC Highway 16.  In addition to the location maps provided in 
this Request for Council Action, the staff is providing copies of the “Offer to Purchase and Contract – 
Vacant Lot/Land” for each of the three parcels.   
 
Recommendation: 
 
Staff recommends the purchase of the three parcels.  A motion to purchase one or more parcels, if made, 
should be made separately and should reference each parcel as follows: 
 
Parcel #1, NCDOT Asset Number 89107, for $500.00 
Parcel #2, NCDOT Asset Number 205914, for $500.00 
Parcel #3, NCDOT Asset Number 205921, for $690.00 
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CITY OF NEWTON 
REQUEST FOR COUNCIL ACTION 

 
 
DATE:  October 1, 2020 
 
TO:  E. Todd Clark, City Manager 
 
FROM:  Sean Hovis, Assistant City Manager  
 
CONSIDERATION OF:  Budget Ordinance Amendment to Provide Funding for Additional COVID-19 
Expenditures  

Approved for Council Consideration 
 
 

______________________________ 
 
 In July, 2020, Session Law 2020-80 was passed which required that counties allocate 25% of their 
allocation of federal CARES Act funds to municipalities within the county. Catawba County’s allocation 
of CARES Act funds was $1,485,626, and the County distributed $267,360 of those funds to the City of 
Newton on August 21, 2020. The City is required to document the use of these funds for allowable COVID-
19 costs incurred from March 1, 2020 through December 30, 2020. Because US Treasury guidance allows 
all Public Safety employees to be presumed to be substantially dedicated to activities related to COVID-19 
and the amount of Public Safety payroll and benefits far exceeds the $267,360 grant amount, County staff 
recommended that the City use Public Safety personnel costs as its documentation of the use of these funds.  
 
City staff prepared the required reporting of Public Safety personnel costs for March and April, which fully 
utilized the $267,360 grant amount. Since the costs were expended in FY2020, the related $267,360 grant 
amount must be recorded in FY2020, resulting in an increase of $267,360 in the General Fund’s Fund 
Balance when FY2020 is closed out. 
 
Since preparing the City’s FY2021 budget, staff has identified several COVID-19 costs that were not 
budgeted. Staff is requesting using some of the $267,360 grant revenue that resulted in additional Fund 
Balance in FY2020 for these additional FY2021 expenditures. 
 
 
The Newton Police Department is requesting an allocation of $17,900. Items to be purchased with the 
funding include but are not limited to portable UV-C room sanitizers, half-facepiece respirator masks, and 
N100 face masks. 
 
The Newton Fire Department is requesting an allocation of $46,106. Items to be purchased with the funding 
include but are not limited to Lucas Devices that are chest compression systems, gowns, and goggles. 
 
The Newton Parks and Recreation Department an allocation of $49,980, which includes equipment and 
PPE for all recreation facilities, parks, cemeteries, and City Hall. Items to be purchased with the funding 
include but are not limited to electrostatic sprayers for the gyms, plexiglass sneeze guards for the concession 
stands, hand sanitizer stations for all centers and City Hall, and temperature scanners.   
Central Recreation - $6573.00 
City Hall/ Finance- $6525.00 
City Hall/Admin- $11,600.00 
Recreation Center- $10,520.00 
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Swimming Pool- $6944.00 
Parks- $5330.00 
Cemeteries- $2488.00 
 
Public Works facility is requesting to purchase 1 UV Sanitizer for the Public Works facility in the amount 
of $5000.00.  
 
Information Technology is requesting $7300.00 for the purchase of addition IPads for remote working, 
Netmotion licensing and camera equipment for remote meetings.    
 
The total request to use funds received for Care Act funding is $126,286.00. 
 
Recommendation: 
  
Staff requests that City Council approve the attached budget ordinance amendment. 
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ORDINANCE  
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND REVENUES AND EXPENDITURES FOR  
FISCAL YEAR 2020-2021 FOR THE CITY OF NEWTON 

 
 WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Newton have adopted a Budget Ordinance for fiscal 
year beginning July 1, 2020, and ending June 30, 2021, in accordance with the General Statutes of the 
State of North Carolina, and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council desires to appropriate additional funds for COVID-19 related costs; 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council desires to approve utilization of fund balance and to approve the 
related expenditure appropriation within the operating budget; and  
  
 NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
NEWTON, NORTH CAROLINA, THAT: 
 
 THE FOLLOWING SOURCE OF REVENUE AND APPROPRIATION ARE HEREBY 
APPROVED.  
 
General Fund Revenues 
      Fund Balance Appropriation    11-0000.3990        $120,000 
      
General Fund Appropriations 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-4132.5620  $   7,300 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-4250.5602  $   5,000 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-4260.5602            $ 18,150  
      COVID-19 Costs     11-4310.5602            $ 17,900 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-4340.5602            $ 46,150      
      COVID-19 Costs     11-6120.5602            $ 10,520 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-6121.5602            $   6,600 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-6122.5602            $   5,350 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-6123.5602            $   7,000 
      COVID-19 Costs     11-6135.5602            $   2,500 
       
 
Adopted this 6th day of October, 2020. 
             
                      Eddie Haupt, Mayor 
 
 
     
  Amy S. Falowski, City Clerk  
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